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RESEARCH & DEVELOPMENT CELL 
DYAL SINGH COLLEGE 

University of Delhi 
NOTICE 

        Date: 22.09.2023    

Dear TICs/ Colleagues/Students  

The Research & Development Cell encourages students to apply for the 

fellowships/scholarships available through various ministries, public and private agencies. Some 

of the opportunities are given below and can be accessed via provided link or explore 

concerned website. Interested students can apply.  

It is also requested to Colleagues to circulate the information 

Regards 
 
 
(Prof. Alka Gutpa) 
Convener 
Research & Development Committee (2023-24) 
 
Name of the 
Fellowship 

Provider 
details  

Link Time Line Eligibility Award 
 

National 
Fellowship and 
scholarship for 
ST students 

Ministry 
of Tribal 
affairs , 
GOI 

https://fellows
hip.tribal.gov.i
n/ 
 

Sept-Nov   Scholarship: 
Must be a admitted to a 
PG/UG program at institute 
notified by Ministry of tribal 
affairs 
Annual family income less 
than 6lacs from all sources  

 
 
Full tuition 
fees or upto 
2.5 lacs+ 
other 
benefits  

Central sector 
Scheme of 
scholarships for 
college and 
University 
students 
 

Departme
nt of 
Higher 
Education 
of MHRD. 

https://www.s
cholarshipsini
ndia.com/cent
ral_sector_sch
eme_of_schol
arship_for_coll
ege_and_univ
ersity_student
s.html 
 
 

Aug-Nov Scholarships to 82,000 
graduate/postgraduate 
students every year. 
Candidates above the 80th 
percentile of successful 
students who have passed 
class 12. Pursuing regular 
UG/PG course 
Annual family income less 
than  INR 8 Lakh 
 

Annual 
scholarship 
amount of 
up to INR 
20,000 till 
the course 
is finished 
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Raman Kant 
Munjal 
Scholarship 

Hero 
Group’s 
Ramakant
Munjal 
Scholarshi
ps offer 
them just 
what they 
need—
financial 
support 
to pursue 
finance-
related 
course 

https://rkmfo
undation.org/s
cholarships/ 
 

Application 
Starting 
Month : 
28th June 
2023 
Application 
Closing 
Month : 
15th 
September 
2023 

Degree Course : BBA, BFIA, 
B.Com (H,E), BMS, IPM, BA 
(Economics), BBI, BAF, BSc 
Stats 
Minimum Qualification 
: Class 12th in 2023 
Age : Maximum 19 years as 
on 31.05.2023 
Annual Family Income : Less 
than Rs. 4 Lakhs 
If the applicant is getting 
admission to colleges and 
courses basis the school 
exam marks, the qualifying 
marks are : 
Class 10th –80% 
Class 12th – 80% 

Scholarship 
of Rs. 
50,000 to 
Rs. 5,00,000 
is awarded 
to each 
student per 
year for a 
period of 3 
years for 
completing 
their 
education. 
(The exact 
scholarship 
amount will 
depend on 
the 
accepted 
college 
fees). 
  
 

Alstom India Alstom 
India 

 Last Date 
to Apply: 
15-09-2023 

Students studying in any 
year of ITI/diploma, general 
graduation, or graduation 
(engineering) STEM courses 
for FY 2023-24 can apply. 
* Applicants must have 
secured at least 60% marks 
in their previous academic 
year/semester. 
* The annual family income 
of the applicants must be 
less than or equal to INR 
6,00,000 from all sources. 
* Preference will be given to 
students residing in locations 
such as Chennai (Tamil 
Nadu), Coimbatore (Tamil 
Nadu), Kolkata (West 
Bengal), Madhepura (Bihar), 
Sri City (Andhra Pradesh), or 
Vadodara (Gujarat). 
* Students pursuing 
graduation in STEM (any 
year) at any of the Alstom 
India specified institutions 
are also eligible to apply. 

Up to INR 
75,000 
(one-time) 

HDFC Bank HDFC https://www.h Last Date The scholarship is open for Up to INR 

https://rkmfoundation.org/scholarships/
https://rkmfoundation.org/scholarships/
https://rkmfoundation.org/scholarships/
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Parivartan’s 
Educational 
Crisis 
Scholarship  
 

Bank  
 

dfcbank.com/
personal/abou
t-us/news-
room/press-
release/2021/
q2/ 
hdfc-bank-
launches-
covid-crisis-
support 
scholarship?L
GCode=MKTG
&icid= 
website_organ
ic_hdfc_search
&mc_id=websi
te_organic_hd
fc_search 

to 
Apply: 30-
09-2023 

Indian nationals only. The 
students must be studying in 
Class 1 to 12, diploma, ITI, 
polytechnic, undergraduate 
or postgraduate (including 
general and professional) 
courses. The applicants must 
have passed their previous 
qualifying examination with 
at least 55% marks and their 
annual family income must 
be less than or equal to INR 
2.5 Lakh. Preference will be 
given to those applicants 
who are facing personal or 
family crises that have 
occurred during the past 
three years due to which 
they are unable to continue 
bearing the cost of 
education and are at risk of 
dropping out. 

75,000 

Kotak Kanya 
Scholarship 
 

Kotak 
Mahindra 
Group 
Companie
s, 

 Last Date 
to Apply: 
30-09-2023 
  
 

Meritorious girl students 
who have secured admission 
to 1st year graduation 
programmes in professional 
courses from institutes of 
repute (NAAC/NIRF 
accredited) can apply. 
Professional courses include 
professional graduation 
courses like Engineering, 
MBBS, Architecture, Design, 
integrated LLB, etc. 
Applicants must have scored 
more than 85% marks in 
their Class 12th board 
examinations. 
Annual family income must 
be Rs. 6,00,000 (Rupees Six 
Lakh) or less from all sources 

Rs. 1.5 lakh* 
per year 

NICE 
Foundation 
Student 
Scholarship  
 

Registrati
on Start 
Date: 
Thursday, 
01 Jun 
2023. 
* Last 
Date of 
Applicatio

 Registratio
n Start 
Date: 
Thursday, 
01 Jun 
2023. 
* Last Date 
of 
Application

Standard : Diploma & Degree 
(Any Stream & Any Year) 
Board / University : Any 
University 
Medium of Exam : English, 
Hindi & Marathi 

Appear for 
the exam  

https://www.hdfcbank.com/personal/about-us/news-room/press-release/2021/q2/
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n: 
Saturday, 
30 Sep 
2023. 

: Saturday, 
30 Sep 
2023. 

JSW UDAAN 
Scholarship for 
Students 
pursuing Under 
Graduate 
Degree courses  

JSW 
Foundatio
n 
 

 Start Date 
From 
22/08/202
3 
Valid Upto 
11/10/202
3 
 

 Minimum 60% in Class 10, 
Minimum 60% in Class 12, 
Scheme is available to only 
student whose family 
income is less than 
800000.00 
Financial Year 2023-2024 
B.sc students can apply 

INR) Max. 
Upto 
30000.00 

Swami 
Dayanand 
Education 
Foundation 
India 
Scholarships 

Swami 
Dayanand 
Education 
Foundatio
n 

 Start Date 
From 
22/08/202
3 
Valid Upto 
11/10/202
3 

75% or above Marks in 
12th/CGPA of at least 7.5 
* Annual Family Income of 
less than INR 6 Lac per 
annum 
50% reservation for female 
candidates 

Scholarships 
up to INR 
50,000/- 

Harvard 
Radcliffe 
Fellowship  
 

  The 
deadline 
for 
application
s in 
humanities, 
social 
sciences, 
and 
creative 
arts 
is Septemb
er 14, 
2023. 
  
The 
deadline 
for 
application
s in 
science, 
engineering
, and 
mathemati
cs 
is October 
5, 2023. 

  

 

 


